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Trust Headquarters 
Russell’s Hall Hospital 
Dudley 
West Midlands 
DY1 2HQ 

Ref: FOI-032024-000695 

Date: 09/04/2024 

Address / Email: 

Dear 

Request Under Freedom of Information Act 2000 

Thank you for requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

Response 

Please see tables below 

If you are dissatisfied with our response, you have the right to appeal in line with guidance from the 
Information Commissioner. In the first instance you may contact the Information Governance Manager 
of the Trust. 

Information Governance Manager 
Trust Headquarters 
Russell’s Hall Hospital 
Dudley 
West Midlands 
DY1 2HQ 
Email: dgft.dpo@nhs.net 

Should you disagree with the contents of our response to your appeal, you have the right to appeal to 
the Information Commissioners Office at. 

Information Commissioners Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
Tel: 0303 123 1113 
www.ico.org.uk 

If you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us. 

Yours sincerely 

Freedom of Information Team 
The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust 
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Year Total 

2019 366 

2020 273 

2021 360 

2022 480 

2023 711 

Grand Total 2190 

Ethnic Category Total 

A 1726 

B <5 

C 30 

D 12 

E <5 

F 6 

G 7 

H 38 

J 70 

K 13 

L 27 

M 36 

N 13 

P 13 

R <5 

S 10 

Z 132 

99 53 

Year Total 

2019 10378 

2020 8837 

2021 10580 

2022 10834 

2023 9078 

Grand Total 49707 

Specialty Total 

502 - Gynaecology 3988 

Grand Total 3988 

This data is all inpatients admitted with a diagnosis of Endometriosis in any 

diagnosis order only.We do not record diagnosis at outpatient clinics. 

This data is all inpatients admitted with a diagnosis of Endometriosis in any 

diagnosis order only.We do not record diagnosis at outpatient clinics. 

Taken from all appointment referrals from 2019-2023. Note these are only 

referrals that have been inputted into OASIS. 

Taken from our RTT Incompletes data from the most recent census 

date of 11/03/24. 

1) The number of women who have been diagnosed with Endometriosis between 2019 to 2023 (i.e. 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023) 

2) Of these number of women diagnosed with Endometriosis, how many are (using the NHS Directory for Ethnic Categories): 

3) The number of female patients who have been issued/received referrals for gynaecological care at any of the local hospitals under your NHS Trust between 2019 to 2023 (i.e. 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023) 

4) The number of female patients awaiting a referral appointment (i.e. are still on the waiting list) for any hospital/specialist centre (whichever is applicable) under your NHS Trust for gynaecological care. 


