
 
 
Date: 11/10/2018 
 
 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST FOI/014397 – Headache/migraine clinic 
 
 
I am writing to you today to request information regarding the treatment of Headaches and Chronic Migraines. 
 
 
1.) Does your trust run a headache clinic?       -      No specific clinics but see patients in General Neurology clinics. 
Patients who need Botox are referred to the headache clinic at Queen Elizabeth Hospital, Birmingham 
 
 
2.) Does your trust run a migraine clinic?      -     No specific clinics but see patients in General Neurology clinics. 
Patients who need Botox are referred to the headache clinic at Queen Elizabeth Hospital Birmingham 
 
 
3.) Does your trust run a botulinum A [botox] clinics (regardless of any indication or department)?    -     YES 
 
 
4.) In the past 6 months how many patients have been treated for chronic migraine?     -     We do not hold patient 
specific disease related information data on our pharmacy database. 
 
 
5.) Could you please provide me with the following numbers of patients treated in the last 6 months, with the 
following drugs for Chronic Migraine. If none, please state None.      -      We do not hold patient specific disease 
related information data on our pharmacy database. 
 
 
• Botox 
• Dysport 
• Xeomin 
• Topiramate / anticonvulsant 
• Beta-blocker 
• Calcium channel blocker 
• Anti-serotonergic 
• Tricyclic anti-depressant 


