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Date: 19/02/2015 

 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 - Ref: FOI/012142 

With reference to your FOI request in connection with 'Retail and commercial spaces' please se response below. 
 

1) a.    How many retail and other commercial spaces are currently leased on hospital premises in your trust?    

b. Please breakdown figure 1a) by name of company.  

    

2) a.    How many retail and other commercial spaces were leased on hospital premises in your trust in February 

2010?    

b. Please breakdown figure 2a) by name of company.  

3) a.    How many retail and other commercial spaces were leased on hospital premises in your trust in February 

2005?    

c. Please breakdown figure 3a) by name of company.  

  

The Trust does not hold this information and the information is not held on behalf of the Trust. 

  

Summit is the landlord, please see details on the Trust's website under the following link:  

http://dudleygroup.nhs.uk/about-us/private-finance-initiative-partners/ 

  

Details for Summit Healthcare (Dudley) Limited: 

General Manager 

Summit Healthcare (Dudley) Limited 

Russells Hall Hospital 

Dudley 

DY1 2HQ 
 

http://dudleygroup.nhs.uk/about-us/private-finance-initiative-partners/

