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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST FOI/012644 — Patients restrained

1. How many patients have been physically restrained by hospital security staff
The figures below are the number of restraints undertaken by the security guards
2010 27
2011 18
2012 13
2013 12
2014 12
2015 16
a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why
2010 Weapon x 2 Aggressive Behaviour x 17 Self Harm x 2 Assault x 6.

2011 Weapon x2 Aggressive Behaviour x 11 Self Harm x1 Assault x4
2012 Weapon xO0 Aggressive Behaviour x 11 Self Harm x0 Assault x 2
2013 Weapon x0 Aggressive Behaviour x5 Self Harm x1 Assaultx 6
2014 Weapon xO0 Aggressive Behaviour x 7 Self Harm x0 Assault x 5
2015 Weapon x 0 Aggressive Behaviour x12 Self Harm x 1 Assaultx 3

How many patients with a learning disability have been physically restrained by hospital security staff
a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why
We do not hold this information.

2. How many times have the police been called because of the behaviour of a patient
2010x 54 (36 X Aggressive Patients 18 x Non Aggressive Patients)

2011 x 33 (27 X Aggressive Patients 6 x Non Aggressive Patients)

2012 x 41 (32 X Aggressive Patients 9 x Non Aggressive Patients)

2013 x 23 (22 X Aggressive Patients 1 x Non Aggressive Patients)

2014 x 25 (23 X Aggressive Patients 2 x Non Aggressive Patients)



2015x 36 (31 X Aggressive Patients 5 x Non Aggressive Patients)
a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why

2010 Aggressive Behaviour x 33 Weapon x 1 Self Harm x2 Assault x3 Confusion/Capacity x 3 Anti Social Behaviour
X6 Section 119/120x 6.

2011 Aggressive Behaviour x 22 Weapon x2 Self Harm x 1 Assault x4 Confusion/Capacity x 2 Anti Social Behaviour
x0 Section 119/120 x 2.

2012 Aggressive Behaviour x 27 Weapon x 1 Self Harm x 1 Assault x 2 Confusion/Capacity x 4 Anti Social
Behaviour x 1 Section 119/120 x 5

2013 Aggressive Behaviour x 8 Weapon x 2 Self Harm x 1 Assault x 10 Confusion/Capacity x 1 Anti Social
Behaviour x 0 Section 119/120 x 1

2014 Aggressive Behaviour x 11 Weapon x 1 Self Harm x 0 Assault x 5 Confusion/Capacity x 3 Anti Social Behaviour
x 1 Section 119/120 x 1 Racial x 3.

2015 Aggressive Behaviour x 14 Weapon x 4 Self Harm x 0 Assault x 9 Confusion/Capacity x 7 Anti Social
Behaviour x 1 Section 119/120 x 1.

b. Please outline what action was taken by the police

2010 Arrest x 12 Unknown x 2 No Action x 26 Transfer/Escort to another medical Facility x 1 Escorted from site x
13.

2011 Arrest x 10 Unknown x3 No Action x9 Transfer/Escort to another medical Facility x 2 Escorted from site by
Police x9 .

2012 Arrest x 6 Unknown x 13 No Action x10 Transfer/Escort to another medical Facility x 3 Escorted from site by
Police x 9.

2013 Arrest x 8 Unknown x 9 No Action x4 Transfer/Escort to another medical Facility x 2 Escorted from site by
Police x0

2014 Arrest x5 Unknown x 12 No Action x 2 Transfer/Escort to another medical Facility x 2 Escorted from site
by Police x 4.

2015 Arrest x5 Unknown x 14 No Action x 13 Transfer/Escort to another medical Facility x 2 Escorted from site by
Police x 2.

3. How many times have the police been called because of the behaviour of a patient with a learning disability
We do not hold this information.
a. Please list a breakdown of the reasons why

b. Please outline what action was taken by the police



