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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST FOI/013649 — Workforce planning/Leaving European Union

Request 1 —

Please confirm or deny if The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust holds any workforce planning document
relating to The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust covering any of the next ten years If confirm, please release
any workforce planning document relating to The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust covering any of the next
ten years

The Trust takes part in a national annual workforce planning exercise which is submitted to Health Education
England. Please find attached the most recent submission (2016). For a copy of this submission please contact
dgft.foi@nhs.net

Request 2

Please confirm or deny if The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust holds information on the number of clinical
staff who are non-British EU nationals working on each (a) A&E shift (b) general surgery shift (c) intensive care
unit shift (d) critical care shift (e) paediatric ward shift (f) geriatric ward shift (g) maternity unit shift (h)
oncology unit shift from (i) Friday 16th June to Thursday 22nd June 2017 (ii) Friday 17th June to Thursday 23rd
June 2016 at The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust.

This information is not held centrally and is held on individual personnel files and as such cannot be supplied.

Request 3

Please confirm or deny if The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust holds information on whether all (a) A&E
shift (b) general surgery shift (c)intensive care unit shift (d) critical care shift (e) paediatric ward shift (f)geriatric
ward shift (g) maternity unit shift (h) oncology unit shift from (i) Friday 16th June to Thursday 22nd June 2017
(ii) Friday 17th June to Thursday 23rd June 2016 at The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust met safe staffing
levels based on (i) The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust's own workforce planning (ii) safe staffing levels as
defined by the Care Quality Commission

If confirm, please release all (a) A&E shift (b) general surgery shift (c)intensive care unit shift (d) critical care
shift (e) paediatric ward shift (f)geriatric ward shift (g) maternity unit shift (h) oncology unit shift from (i)Friday
16th June to Thursday 22nd June 2017 (ii) Friday 17th June to Thursday23rd June 2016 at The Dudley Group
NHS Foundation Trust met safe staffing levels based on (i) The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust's own
workforce planning (ii) safe staffing levels as defined by the Care Quality Commission

The CQC has not defined any staffing levels, the information attached is from the Trust’s own plan, where the
information is for Nurses excluding A&E.

Please see the response below for ED and Medicine.
Information for other medical areas was not available.

ED Unfilled Shifts

Medics Jun-16 Jun-17
Consultant 0 0

Middle Grade 1 day shift 1 day shift
Junior 0 0

Nursing Jun-16 Jun-17



RN 5 long day shifts 8 long day shifts
Gen Medicine Unfilled Shifts

Medics Jun-16 Jun-17
Consultant 0 0
Middle Grade 0 0
Junior 0 0
Request 4

Please confirm or deny if The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust has carried out any written assessment of
the effects of leaving (a) the European Union (b) the European Medicines Agency (c) Euratom on (i) The Dudley
Group NHS Foundation Trust (ii) The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust 's workforce(iii) patient access to
medicines and treatments

If confirm, please release any written assessment of the effects of leaving (a) the European Union (b) the
European Medicines Agency (c) Euratom on(i) The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust (ii) The Dudley Group
NHS Foundation Trust ’s workforce (iii) patient access to medicines and treatments

No such assessment has been undertaken

Request 5

Please confirm or deny if The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust holds any impact assessments, risk registers
or similar documents on the effects of leaving (a) the European Union (b) the European Medicines Agency
(c)Euratom on (i) The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust (ii) The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust’s
workforce (iii) patient access to medicines and treatments

If confirm, please release all impact assessments, risk registers or similar documents on the effects of leaving (a)
the European Union (b) the European Medicines Agency (c) Euratom on (i) Southend University Hospital NHS
Foundation Trust (ii) The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust (iii) patient access to medicines and treatments
held by The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust

We have not undertaken any impact assessments

Request 6

Please confirm or deny if The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust holds any communications involving (a) any
employee of The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust (b) NHS England (c) NHS Improvement (d) Health
Education England(e) any other arm’s length body of the Department of Health (f) the Department of Health (g)
any other government Department on the impact of leaving the European Union on The Dudley Group NHS
Foundation Trust If confirm, please release any communications involving (a) any employee of Southend
University Hospital NHS Foundation Trust (b) NHS England (c) NHS Improvement (d) Health Education England
(e) any other arm’s length body of the Department of Health (f) the Department of Health (g) any other
government Department on the impact of leaving the European Union on The Dudley Group NHS Foundation
Trust 's workforce

We do not hold any communication from any of these bodies



