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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST FOI/013973 – Foley catheter 

 
1. What is the average length of time per patient to change a Foley catheter? 
Length of time not recorded 
 
 
2. Of those patients who have a Foley catheter, what proportion do you estimate will develop a CAUTI? 
Data not recorded 
 
 
3. How many patients today have a CAUTI in your Trust? 
Data collected for submission to NHS Safety Thermometer, please find attached latest submission 
 
 
4. On average (in days), when does the patient develop a CAUTI? 
Data not recorded 
 
 
5. How many times a day (24 hours) do you assist patients with a CAUTI? 
Unable to answer, this would depend on the patient. 


