
 
 

Date: 11/09/2018 
 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST FOI/014335 – CAUTI 

 

Under the Freedom of Information Act, please could you provide the following information for all the Trusts you cover: 
 
 
1. What is the average length of time per patient to assist with a CAUTI?  -   Data not recorded 
 
 
2. How many nosocomial CAUTIs were there in your trust last year? What is your position on the safety thermometer 
for CAUTI?   -   Please see attached 
 
 
3. What 3 main actions have the trust deployed or is planning to deploy to reduce nosocomial CAUTIs?   -  the 
Trust has in place a catheter care bundle, monthly high impact intervention audits on urinary catheters and is just 
launching a health economy wide catheter passport 
 
 
4. What is the impact on increased length of stay for an average patient in your trust with a CAUTI – how many days 
on average?   -   Data not recorded 
 
 
5. What is the increased per patient cost of a nosocomial CAUTI? (e.g. extended hospital stay, nursing time, drug 
treatment, bed blocking etc.)   -   Data not recorded 


