

Trust Headquarters Russells Hall Hospital Dudley West Midlands DY1 2HQ

Ref: FOI-082025-0001814

Date: 18.9.25

Address / Email:

Dear

## **Request Under Freedom of Information Act 2000**

Thank you for requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

I am analysing the treatment of dermatological conditions in the UK. Could you please answer the following questions.

Q1. In the 4 months (Apr 25-Jul 25) the following number of patients have been issued the listed treatments (for any condition), from the Dermatology Department:

Treatment	PT Count
Abrocitinib	0
Acitretin	81
Alitretinoin	5
Azathioprine	14
Baricitinib	2
Ciclosporin	50
Dupilumab	70
Lebrikizumab	18
Methotrexate	130
Mycophenolate mofetil	17
Pimecrolimus	12
** Phototherapy (UVB or PUVA) - for Atopic Dermatitis only	
Tacrolimus ointment	108
Tralokinumab	16
Upadacitinib	17
Nemolizumab	0

<sup>\*\*</sup> Information is not recorded electronically so we are unable to run a report for the data requested.

Q2. Of the Patients counted in Q1, for the treatments listed below, the following number of patients are considered newly initiated (had not been issued the treatment during Aug 24-Mar 25):

Treatment	NEW PT Count		
Abrocitinib	0		
Baricitinib	0		
Dupilumab	5		
Lebrikizumab	12		
Tralokinumab	2		
Upadacitinib	1		
Nemolizumab	0		

Q3. Of the Patients counted in Q1, the age distribution of Patients issued the listed treatments is as follows:

				Age 18 and
Treatment	Age 6mnths-5	Age 6-11	Age 12-17	above
Abrocitinib	0	0	0	0
Acitretin	0	0	1	80
Alitretinoin	0	0	0	5
Azathioprine	0	0	0	14
Baricitinib	0	0	0	2
Ciclosporin	0	0	3	47
Dupilumab	0	0	0	70
Lebrikizumab	0	0	0	18
Methotrexate	0	2	6	122
Mycophenolate mofetil	0	0	0	17
Pimecrolimus	3	1	0	8
** Phototherapy (UVB or PUVA) - for Atopic Dermatitis only				
Tacrolimus ointment	5	3	5	95
Tralokinumab	0	0	0	16
Upadacitinib	0	0	0	17
Nemolizumab	0	0	0	0

<sup>\*\*</sup> Information is not recorded electronically so we are unable to run a report for the data requested.

If you are dissatisfied with our response, you have the right to appeal in line with guidance from the Information Commissioner. In the first instance you may contact the Information Governance Manager of the Trust.

Information Governance Manager Trust Headquarters Russell's Hall Hospital Dudley West Midlands DY1 2HQ

Email: dgft.dpo@nhs.net

Should you disagree with the contents of our response to your appeal, you have the right to appeal to the Information Commissioners Office at.

Information Commissioners Office

FOI/REF FOI-

Wycliffe House Water Lane Wilmslow Cheshire SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113 www.ico.org.uk

If you require further clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Yours sincerely

Freedom of Information Team
The Dudley Group NHS Foundation Trust